
Corporate Partnership Opportunities and Benefits

Basic 
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ShowBiz 
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Director's Circle
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Sponsorship Opportunity Single 
Performance JAW Programs Studio Show Main Stage 

Show Studio Season Main Stage 
Season

All Season 
Productions

All Season 
Activity

Benefits $1,000 $2,500 $5,000 $5,000 $5,000 $10,000 $25,000 $50,000 $100,000 $150,000

Logo recognition on show posters X X

Premium logo placement in collateral** X X X

Share a bottle of wine and/or coffee 
with Artistic Director prior to the show 
of your choice (once per year for up to 6 
people)

X X X

Logo in season brochure and season 
renewal materials* X X X X

Link from logo to corporate website X X X X X

Logo on website X X X X X

Logo in "Supporter" section of playbill X X X X X

Opportunity to attend one tech 
rehearsal per year with Artistic Director 
and Managing Director (maximum 10 
guests)

X X X X X

Logo recognition in show/program 
specific collateral** X X X X X X X X

Logo in playbill on title page of 
sponsored show/event X X X X X X X X

Listed on website X X X X X X X X

Complimentary bottle of wine and 
reserved table prior to the show of your 
choice (up to 2x per year)

X X X X X X X X

Recognition in press releases for 
sponsored event/show (if applicable) X X X X X X X X

Customized behind-the-scenes 
experiences with Managing Director (1 
per year for up to 10 people)

X X X X X X X X

Invitation to Exclusive Season Preview 
Event X X X X X X X X

Free Drink Vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 6 vouchers 8 vouchers 10 vouchers 15 vouchers 20 vouchers

Free Opportunity to Host Private Event 
(sponsor pays for food and beverages) - 
1 per year

Standing 
reception - max 

25 people

Standing 
reception - max 

50 people

Standing 
reception - max 

50 people

Standing 
reception - max 

100 people

Standing 
reception - max 

100 people

Combo 
dinner/reception - 

max 25 people

Combo 
dinner/reception - 

max 50 people

Combo 
dinner/reception - 

max 50 people

Combo 
dinner/reception - 
max 100 people

Combo 
dinner/reception - 
max 100 people

Free Ticket Vouchers 2 vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 4 vouchers 6 vouchers 8 vouchers 10 vouchers 15 vouchers 20 vouchers

Invitation to Annual Corp Appreciation 
Day X X X X X X X X X X

Invitations for primary contact(s) to 
Main Stage Opening Night pre-show 
receptions

X X X X X X X X X X

Listed in playbill (70K subscribers) X X X X X X X X X X

Periodic invitations to special events 
with Artistic Director, leadership staff, 
and board members

X X X X X X X X X X

Access to 2-for-1 tickets during the first 
two weeks of regular production 
(excludes special engagements)

X X X X X X X X X X

VIP concierge service for all ticket 
reservations provided by development 
department

X X X X X X X X X X

Additional and/or revisied benefits 
based on your company's need X X X X X X X X X X

  * Commitment to sponsorship by March 5, 2023 is required

** Excludes social media and advertising


